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Money Driven Boxing Club - Fort Wayne
   
Welcome to Money Driven Boxing Club in Fort Wayne, Indiana

  Are you ready to take your boxing skills to the next level? At Money Driven
Boxing Club, we focus on building a community that encourages everyone,
from beginners to pros. With a strong emphasis on fundamentals and
personalized training, our club is designed to help you achieve your boxing
goals.  
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Membership Required

  To join our vibrant boxing community, a membership is required. This ensures
you receive access to all our training sessions, coaching, and facilities. Our
members appreciate being part of a supportive and motivating environment.  

Active Military Discounts

  In recognition of their service, we proudly offer active military discounts. We
value the dedication and sacrifices made by our armed forces and want to
extend our services to them at a reduced cost.  

Planning Your Training

  At Money Driven Boxing Club, careful planning is key to maximizing your
training experience. Our coaches collaborate with you to develop a structured
training plan tailored to your individual goals, ensuring you progress efficiently
and effectively.  

Service Options

  We provide a variety of service options to cater to different skill levels and
preferences. Whether you're looking to improve your boxing technique, lose
weight, or simply enjoy a new fitness regime, there’s something for everyone.
Our friendly trainers deliver insightful tips and support to ensure a fulfilling
experience.  

Appointment Required

  To provide personalized attention and focused training, an appointment is
required for initial sessions. This allows our coaches to assess your skill level
and design a training plan that works best for you.  

Highlights of Money Driven Boxing Club

   Experienced coaching staff passionate about boxing. Inclusive atmosphere
welcoming all skill levels. Structured training plans to enhance performance. 
Community-oriented environment fostering motivation. Intense and fun training
sessions ideal for weight loss.   

Accessibility

  We strive for full accessibility within our club. Our facilities are designed to be
welcoming and functional for everyone, including those with mobility challenges.  

On-site Services
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  Money Driven Boxing Club offers various on-site services to enhance your
training experience. From group classes to one-on-one coaching sessions, we
are dedicated to providing top-notch services in a supportive setting.  

Wheelchair-Accessible Car Park

  We are committed to serving all members of the community. Our 
wheelchair-accessible car park ensures that everyone can easily access our
gym facilities without any barriers.  

Join Us Today!

  Experience the benefits of joining the Money Driven Boxing Club family. With
our excellent coaching, supportive community, and comprehensive training
options, you’re sure to find a place to thrive. Don’t hesitate, become part of the
best gym in Fort Wayne today!    
Our business is located at

  
 1914 Bluffton Rd, 46809  Fort Wayne, Indiana - United States  (US) 
 
         
 
   
    
 

We are available at these times:

    Day Hours    Monday 5–7?PM   Tuesday 5–7?PM   Wednesday 5–7?PM   Thursday Closed   Friday Closed   Saturday Closed   Sunday 5–7?PM        The website is Money Driven Boxing Club       If you require to update any information that you consider is not precise
related to this site, we kindly request send us a message so that we will fix it at
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the earliest convenience. In advance thanks for your cooperation. 
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