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Planet Fitness - Alton
   
Discover Planet Fitness in Alton, Illinois

  If you’re seeking a welcoming environment to kickstart or continue your fitness
journey, Planet Fitness in Alton, Illinois is definitely worth considering. This
gym stands out for its approach to member experience and accessibility.  

Atmosphere and Community

  The atmosphere at Planet Fitness is designed to be friendly and
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non-intimidating. With ample space and typically low crowd levels, members can
focus on their workouts without feeling chaotic pressure. Many visitors
appreciate the warm greetings from the staff, which fosters a sense of
community. As one member commented, "It's a great place to work out without
feeling pressured or out of place."  

Accessibility Features

  Accessibility is a priority at this location, featuring a wheelchair-accessible
entrance and parking options, ensuring everyone can enjoy their fitness
experience. The gym includes a wheelchair-accessible car park, making it
easier for those with mobility challenges to visit and exercise comfortably.  

Facilities and Amenities

  Planet Fitness in Alton boasts excellent facilities, including clean locker rooms
and individual shower stalls. Members have commented on the cleanliness of
both the gym and the bathrooms, stating, "the gym and bathrooms were clean
and it wasn't busy when I went." The presence of private shower facilities
enhances the overall experience, giving members a chance to refresh after their
workouts.  

Planning Your Membership

  A membership is required to access all the amenities this gym offers, which
include cardio machines, weightlifting equipment, and bonus features like
hydro-massage beds. Members highlight the variety of equipment available,
making it suitable for all fitness levels—from beginners to seasoned athletes.  

Final Thoughts

  Overall, Planet Fitness in Alton, IL, receives high praise for its clean
environment, supportive staff, and welcoming community spirit. As noted by
several members, “I would highly recommend this location to anyone looking for
a positive and supportive fitness experience.” So whether you’re planning to join
for the first time or looking for a new gym, consider giving Planet Fitness a visit!    
You will find us at

  
 3000 Homer M Adams Pkwy, 62002  Alton, Illinois - United States  (US) 
 
     
 
The contact line of this Gym  is +1618-433-1816
 
And if you want to send a WhatsApp, you can do so at+1618-433-1816
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We are available at these times:

    Day Hours    Monday Open 24 hours   Tuesday Open 24 hours   Wednesday Open 24 hours   Thursday Open 24 hours   Friday Open 24 hours   Saturday Open 24 hours   Sunday Open 24 hours        The website is Planet Fitness       If necessary to alter any information that you feel is not correct regarding
this portal, we ask send us a message and we will handle it at the earliest
convenience. In advance thanks. 
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