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Jackson R. Lehman Family Ymca - Fort Wayne
   
Exploring the Jackson R. Lehman Family YMCA in Fort Wayne, Indiana

  The **Jackson R. Lehman Family YMCA** has established itself as a beloved
community hub in Fort Wayne, Indiana. With a variety of amenities catering to
all age groups, this recreation center offers something for everyone from
basketball enthusiasts to families looking for a friendly place to stay active.  

A Hub for Basketball Lovers

  One of the standout features of the Jackson R. Lehman YMCA is its
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**basketball court**. It serves as a gathering place for both casual players and
serious competitors. Many visitors commend the professional management of
games by staff who create an engaging and efficient atmosphere that keeps
members returning for more.  

Accessibility for All

  A crucial aspect of the Jackson R. Lehman YMCA is its commitment to
**accessibility**. The facility includes a **wheelchair-accessible car park** and a
**wheelchair-accessible entrance**, ensuring easy access for everyone. The
accommodating features highlight the YMCA's dedication to fostering an
inclusive environment.  

A Range of Amenities

  Members enjoy a variety of **amenities** including a well-maintained
**swimming pool** that accommodates both recreational swimming and lap
lanes. However, some feedback suggests that while the pool area is generally
appealing, there have been occasional complaints regarding pool staff
professionalism and oversight. A warm water therapy pool and indoor splash
pad further enhance the family-friendly atmosphere.  In addition to aquatic
facilities, visitors appreciate the diverse range of fitness equipment available
including free weights, cardio machines, and a walking track. The weight room,
although sometimes crowded, provides ample options for members of all fitness
levels.  

Family-Friendly Features and Childcare

  Families particularly value the childcare services offered at the YMCA, allowing
parents to work out without worry. The **child watch** feature provides a safe
and engaging environment where children can play while their parents take
advantage of the facilities. The staff's genuine passion for their work has earned
praise from many parents, reinforcing the YMCA's reputation as a welcoming
community space.  

Room for Improvement

  While the Jackson R. Lehman YMCA is celebrated for its positive atmosphere
and friendly staff, several areas could benefit from enhancement. Members
have suggested expanding the weight room and offering dedicated adult
changing rooms for improved privacy. Additionally, addressing concerns
regarding pool staff behavior and ensuring smoother operational hours for
aquatic activities would greatly enhance the visitor experience.  

Conclusion

  Overall, the **Jackson R. Lehman Family YMCA** stands out as a premier
location for fitness and community engagement in Fort Wayne, Indiana. With its
extensive amenities, commitment to accessibility, and family-friendly
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atmosphere, it has become a favorite among locals. Whether you’re interested
in a friendly game of basketball, a refreshing swim, or simply a place to connect
with others, this YMCA promises an enriching experience for all.    
Our premises are located at

  
 5680 YMCA Pk Dr W, 46835  Fort Wayne, Indiana - United States  (US) 
 
     
 
The contact phone of the mentioned Recreation center  is +1260-755-4949
 
And if you want to send a WhatsApp, you can do so at+1260-755-4949
 
    
 
   
    
 

We are open during the following hours:

    Day Hours    Monday 5?AM–9?PM   Tuesday 5?AM–9?PM   Wednesday 5?AM–9?PM   Thursday 5?AM–9?PM   Friday 7?AM–6?PM   Saturday 12–5?PM   Sunday 5?AM–9?PM        The website is Jackson R. Lehman Family YMCA       If you need to alter any element that you think is not correct regarding this
web, please send us a message so we can we will handle it at the earliest
convenience. Thank you in advance we appreciate it. 

Images

3/14

https://www.openstreetmap.org/directions?to=41.132109199999995%2C-85.0703199#map=15/41.132109199999995/-85.0703199
tel:+1260-755-4949
https://wa.me/+598+1260-755-4949
https://www.fwymca.org/locations/jackson-r-lehman-family-ymca


Jackson r lehman family ymca videos
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Jackson r lehman family ymca score

Jackson r lehman family ymca recreation center
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Jackson r lehman family ymca how to get there

Jackson r lehman family ymca fort wayne
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